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ITEM1 HDPE TUBING DR-9 UNIT
30,000 ft PRICE 0.17 0.17 0.18 0.22 0.30 NO BID
1. Tubing HDPE DR-9 CTS 3/4 IN, 100 ft roll copper tubing size, SAWS #39669 [TOTAL 5,100.00 5,100.00 5,400.00 6,600.00 9,000.00
UNIT
10,000 ft PRICE 0.28 0.28 0.30 0.3683 0.042 NO BID
2. Tubing HDPE DR-9 CTS 1 IN, 100 ft roll copper tubing size, SAWS #39670 [TOTAL 2,800.00 2,800.00 3,000.00 3,683.00 420.00
UNIT
5,000 ft PRICE 0.61 0.57 0.63 0.7728 0.81 NO BID
3. Tubing HDPE DR-9 CTS 1/2 IN, 100 ft roll copper tubing size, SAWS #39671 [TOTAL 3,050.00 2,850.00 3,150.00 3,864.00 4,050.00
UNIT
5,000 ft PRICE 1.04 0.99 1.07 1.3375 1.26 NO BID
4. Tubing HDPE DR-9 CTS 2 IN, 100 ft roll copper tubing size, SAWS #39672 [TOTAL 5,200.00 4,950.00 5,350.00 6,687.50 6,300.00
*
TOTAL FORITEM 1 TOTAL 16,150.00 15,700.00 16,900.00 20,834.50 19,770.00 NO BID
Centennial Plastics
Manufacturer Name & Product No. ADS ADS CenFlo HDPE
ITEM 2 LONG STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS FOR DR-9 HDPE PIPE UNIT
8,000 ea. PRICE 0.68 1.26 1.19 1.760 NO BID NO BID
1. Insert Long S/S for HDPE CTS 3/4 IN copper tubing size, SAWS #39673 TOTAL 5,440.00 10,080.00 9,520.00 14,080.00
UNIT
2,500 ea. PRICE 0.79 1.33 1.26 1.86 NO BID NO BID
2. Insert Long S/S for HDPE CTS 1 IN copper tubing size, SAWS #39674 TOTAL 1,975.00 3,325.00 3,150.00 4,650.00
UNIT
600 ea. PRICE 1.43 1.94 1.70 2.54 NO BID NO BID
3. Insert Long S/S HDPE DR-9 CTS 1 1/2 IN copper tubing size, SAWS #39675 [TOTAL 858.00 1,164.00 1,020.00 1,524.00
UNIT
900 ea. PRICE 1.48 1.94 1.70 2.54 NO BID NO BID
4, Insert Long S/S for HDPE CTS 2 IN copper tubing size, SAWS #39676 TOTAL 1,332.00 1,746.00 1,530.00 2,286.00
*
NO BID NO BID
TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 TOTAL 9,605.00 16,315.00 15,220.00 22,540.00
AY McDonald
Manufacturer Name & Product No. Ford White Rhino 6133T
EXTENSION 1 9,605.00 15,700.00
EXTENSION 2 9,605.00 15,700.00
EXTENSION 3 9,605.00 15,700.00
EXTENSION 4 9,605.00 15,700.00
Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*LOW BIDDER




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-1417

(2]
SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM S .
P. O. BOX 2449 > 3 _5 g g._
[a
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 PR & s =g 2 3 @
TABULATION OF BIDS 5 R R ER > R O ;s =
- S=x % § X < x 2 X VIE g
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Copper Tubing Size HDPE £ :'; = = c sh == k) E S w
FOR: DR-9 Pipe (Copper Tubing Size) =52 g 22 s 2 2322 g 3 8 %‘
TIME & (October 1, 2018 through September 30, 2019) S &L 3L v S 2 g Z 2 cHm =
oW s d o S £EZ 2 X — £ 5o o> Q
DATE: 3:00 p.m., June 20, 2018 3~ < o & < =a < S < 29 @ o
595§ 555 52§ £S5 £35S =
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY L < »n O4dwm L. oo wn Owuwm ; o 0 T
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY::
Act Pipe & Supply Hill Country Electric Supply Demandstar
AY McDonald Hydro Pro Solutions SAWS Website
Cohen Pipe Milford Online
Core & Main Scruggs Co.
Corix Western Water & Gas Products
Ferguson
Fortiline
Gajeske, Inc.




